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CHARACTERISTICS EGO VIEW AWARENESS TIME 
RANGE OF 
UNDERSTANDING PHASE ABILITY  

5th Dimension        

Peace, Rational Mind has 
minimal role. Cooperation not 
competition. Contentment. 
Instant Karma One With All 

Seeing 
though the 
eyes of God 

Divine Creator 
Awareness 

All Time Is 
Now. Mastery 
of every 
thought and 
emotion is 
paramount. 

Peace, Bliss, Joy, Pure 
Consciousness 

Things 
happen 
as me 

Instantaneous 
Creation. No 
Resistance 

4th Dimension        

Unconditional Love, options 
and choices, access to 
intuition at will, allowing, 
happy, certain, grateful, 
gracious, observe without 
judgment, release of 
absolutes, synchronicities are 
common. Neutral  

Letting go of 
judgments, 
assumptions 

Looking within for 
validation and 
self love. Self 
love emerges as 
feeling. 

Time Is 
malleable and 
speeds up. 
Focus is In the 
now. 

Willingness, Optimism, 
Acceptance, Trusting, 
Forgiveness, Genius level 
creativity, Empathy and 
Compassion, Allowing, 
Gratitude, Unconditional 
love seen as in own best 
self interest. 

Things 
happen 
through 
or by me 

Ability to 
Create 
Miracles 
Quickly 

3rd Dimension        

Conditional Love, Laws, 
Rules, Regulations, 
Your/Mine, Institutions, habits, 
competition, not good enough 
yet, fear, limitations and fixed 
ridged beliefs, Always and 
Never, Strong Reactions to 
the unwanted. 

Wanting, 
Thwarted 
Wanting, 
Indifference 

Seeing in 
judgment 

Focus outside of 
ones self for love 
and help. 
Absences of 
feeling love for 
self.  

Linier Time Is 
Law. Focus is 
on past or 
future. 
Reactionary in 
present time. 

Shame, Humiliation, Grief, 
Guilt, Blame, Hopeless, 
Despair, Apathy, Fear, 
Anxiety, Anger, Desire. 
Craving, Greed, Inflationary 
Pride, Demanding and 
Condemning  

Things 
happen 
to me or 
through 
force of 
will 

Very Limited 
Ability to 
Create 
Miracles.  
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